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To be completely honest right off the bat, I myself have never read---nor truly have any current desire to read---the
classic novel Moby Dick in its entirety.

I know that sounds like such a strong, perhaps unfairly dismissive stance to take, especially since Herman Melville's
rather dense novel first published in 1851 is highly regarded as one of the literary world's greatest novels. But,
frankly, after an early attempt at tackling it during my younger days at school (I barely made it past a few pages), the
mere idea of reading through it even now as an adult has always intimidated me.

Thus, my first-hand exposures to the story of the infamous, titular whale and the obsessive ship captain hunting it
have always been isolated just in the world of TV and film. But, admittedly, even in those more easily digestible
mediums, the story never really resonated that much with me.

So, understandably, I approached South Coast Repertory's brand new live offering of MOBY DICK with equal parts
cautiousness and, yes, open-mindedness (after all, SCR continually surprises me, so why not).

And, boy, I gotta say... keeping an open mind can be very rewarding sometimes!

Why? Because this incredibly absorbing play is one of the most stunning and enthralling pieces of theater I have had
the privilege of experiencing from a Southern California stage. Continuing through February 19 at Orange County's
Tony Award-winning regional theater in Costa Mesa, this highly creative and mesmerizing play---adapted and
directed by David Catlin---is a production from Chicago's highly regarded Lookingglass Theatre Company, who also
produced similar successful runs of this adaptation at the ALLIANCE THEATRE in Atlanta and the Arena Stage in

1/6

http://www.broadwayworld.com/los-angeles/article/BWW-Review-Thrilling-Production-of-MOBY-DICK-Swims-into-South-Coast-Repertory-20170213
http://www.broadwayworld.com/people/Herman-Melville/
http://www.broadwayworld.com/people/South-Coast-Repertory/
http://www.broadwayworld.com/people/David-Catlin/
http://www.broadwayworld.com/people/Lookingglass-Theatre-Company/
http://www.broadwayworld.com/people/ALLIANCE-THEATRE/
http://www.broadwayworld.com/people/Arena-Stage/
http://trends.revcontent.com/click.php?d=6RlLNyCjTZIiywAEHHOypG1qCtitWjAQB6CaQ2CqI9BJezP8R2ZAL1R8RQVcywbkuDYdWVNX40c0HxRDDTTyGVBatBn61%2B6aU9QBWBr2E7XSj1m3vmCZ1BA%2BGyskGzAFmZtgyHRBoy8dyuwfUEA4d7WZ4XskDTeqO4iQ0A3JkiWOss5gMoqtR5nM6tNRSE8pyW3CZKEOa5XG8B1UWRL4oYIzPa3oY%2BLmZydUHWQgP661lIUihIsYTHqPe1Iy%2BFGvcytRrv%2FCaWWUnEbfI%2FKeJkb%2B%2Bopb5vS0%2BoPaK5L5l5rb9%2FFyuHfNsHehIaGRboc2Vck7OwrFIzW7y7JmefD%2FJRJObs3ultV9xSqgTtvcB6zThwpRXANk7aiOybWXhdDkLuu1BwJTCOtsA8iRX%2Bc%2Flu0GrFv0VYteTsMchmClc27fJO0VQlRPWVq%2B%2BhZdRKNJAvIrdjGlYecdctmXjpjpPidrA3nzU8glTr37%2FYx8E3SG6qqie9lEeca6nDI53Zn7dFYtAdWEyU6LdocVzo2rjy891R9jue5KVqY44PquG0wKtbv%2BqSRrLEXq95D3NMtwwKXfJRVV%2FMRswB6YWOSxDqjVeGmJxZM4AyavCRsZW99zgz%2FAfLSNWmQBEhTcvAwMNZ4CBwbubkeFzHu7e6Dm9QEaxQIJ0uJHOqoyyEKSZ%2BUE%2BvkAUs5krA2pAWu35AbY4SHS1i3yJtQNQxJ%2F6YukYtVg8x245nv8UQjIHyD%2B5XAjpA4Pc4%2BYp4pUNIerEOlmQozTa7phCwzSzZ0mXcyqvdTLkNV9Dt4yUuRawynfqEY1vtUuh4Yyc%2B0Ka07HAl4N
http://trends.revcontent.com/click.php?d=yI6vFeir978YHLHh5lty2fF%2BPQX%2BIocTHwwTXbg8aBXjU2E4Kxr7s3jvcpAAdHy4tSzGbElMEXupNlgNfG1xBvyglhKoFV1w0BPPMk%2FJvklpTqgLDYHtFSvvAFa2Y5zh0rI%2BkLI4iNOZcnuNxwCsvWLFO0Lm%2FGqUUBYgHrxxu6X1yaC1FVQr8gg3SiGyIm0NHsuY7EN3wsZJwZkHlJW7qdNGmI29i7UTTTS97j6HfOk5H2VOIaJW0JIfyYZHqMCmH3KTjfpmSgNnYpIQaEdTtGE6xwyIBchAWXWNCjBWkw8AwX4ERdmbh3fbtxK%2Bruo4Mi08HzpAANpV%2BEr8qdIBbMU1wLpadqtuqg3GjmCEd3HgEyB0wcwW4sGHdYhqvlpzCRS096O8xk2j%2FJS7UEeI2QiJTzEuJoPxRsqoQo%2BKlIZr9F2QTDfpc3pna9d8SXfrplsjHHuS723rN0vAHanXzgRSVbrVRrd00tAPK23eoINlliEqVJrUP68A7SYWFKLZ6m2%2B4GOPpsdSAyrDZQ1mY7WcJ110gIOXpeO2BEKxBJsBR3L%2FBeatvhxGkd%2FZmUOeaSvyjQoil0N%2FFaEiMq9W9NTFdO6J%2Fg8oRTY%2FCZO9VMCCBYsVDUJGtMcfhaP1TRqIF7f%2BgHTfG530ZaUcQphhumNfWMc%2Fnjbf5%2BzrUGw5JkNLDmOynLaZn1gpMGmBKY4gQC9VWhQYRveg0h8OWijZ1ou%2Fxndx18AtofzmetNtNKn2Oa3bnlIXO6F10tZ7EB0Awijw3uQEgYes7ZGDccCTX68b77RA2HjuzJca5CCwQvi05OP0nYNYWZ8u42p0YLOnAy7kKY%2BP8jdwK6Xlmt0yMA%3D%3D
http://trends.revcontent.com/click.php?d=WcrR5vDf%2FNeUxLbvdyTMqtPqHAFEyKqxOkS0cMhK1Ca1eaUAa2kmTIWAGjE9jHXKa%2BND2KjC8F8X8lLe1YWmW8diy4WArXTz1qlVbA8zANAN3IkZgGfvFXtPIi40pQ87vxZLDQMWHrWdfNE%2F2BBampcL0TAvNCRX6mnJ%2FvvlnjRRExclWb046y2T3C7pb154CV165WhBNM7ppd4xAs252nZBwJBNXb%2FFnIByk56IGT7ucBZQw1yMlaUsA4%2BkJ8TvRrmo4QguDuNNochobB4jsjFX2yVWTE75NpKGXMzMCdBv57hwUcColAM5e6S5NweFYHyUbtK4HEBMfeMMk1n7AEl3d1nq7Jcz%2FLVpmok3TK0O5HXr2U%2Fo1a%2Bj%2Bn%2BDRfqUcYXSYy5WPXLyB4UdwEQQAC1UY3L8jVGKATN10B8Zrhos5mWXPj6%2F1tWK9NmFYzisuzYz7YhT9GaotamlxTtWAhPnb0wY8yTEZ%2BQLEXY8eYSd9roJyVel5vqUakdgsUt94EC9PmKaOASIyw5vYrQaxFKKQrSniJoggVISayc5H%2BV2MmGRV3ArYDrc7UVvyFR6LXEhaTewL61b%2B%2FrQutpQFz6k%2Fv1eqkBUFaZA0Dthgg2hYwyzX%2Fu83nE6NrXlzyWLFDnxyjZ5xVf2jZKpbuRaIay1nqYjbu4i8IxKnYxgIjTTVi5%2B%2BJnXGjzCh%2FCRuaXYSh%2FTlizmgp0HJF9Yv%2FzMZ%2Bq%2BoZjEdy5LwabIcD6fzUtjco1IHK8%2BIxNFooQ9SuNt5qPd73ksgEcXlUbOC9OsKBMbrp%2FeL3cUzEzhkodjhqw%3D
http://trends.revcontent.com/click.php?d=dMLUphew3YgBx59Uz948soobSoENLCP%2BpHwlMKNtVq%2FuMBr9Vkk%2BJCCrHzACZQjFWi237Zl1aRexM4f3%2F7boCzNDJtQrrCROaGes7ZOIdPBAdObjEY30aT%2BJ9oLyGusdzazBbp%2F1YFEfAjU0f%2BT3%2FQmgtcQ8p1XYtLoExegSGIiCWDSWyroACVEf9VSCZmz6qrQ0%2BdJuS1YYcuw6E9TNZzYFV%2B30sil69MQlIGdUEpwU2pZaZYvu7e%2BSqsnI64pRldEM5Ewo7nS34UbTDCa90DOshkR1dU70MuOrVBl2J0rgy6um9sDAP2Sdpq5AYIOA%2FmVlp5WazKJb9GB6nO1YJBapGrYoPOjwow4xdv2x%2F65nKXPDCsacrHd7oRljJkp37He%2BAjEmNufnp9B%2B7%2B2hvBHzCiY4MdHe4%2F4O2sCkERux2QMFxGMDEz3N%2FDreWDmmw1u0P%2FTXJvcr9lLVcza0Mnes6bCE7XEssidMofFEGi3DyXRUVzauKh23veZ0mgSBgD34vvdvM8zsdHigQTeIh9ePFYdLgDadGg%2FEEEi6BSv%2BnWUelkUJL61pgB7BfvNOy9lKXWi%2BGkeJaNDoLITIq6pigJ8BYe%2FXmzDGrMiWAbkxA%2BQj9IjWgG1a78ZqY9rJG7X67etRXzIzUzggR%2FCP0ZOij5%2F%2FPC%2BJQaTwO31adqZMusK3E3CqVzmDEekfLDqxLMQa5DGzAY3ktdVefhyjFg%3D%3D
http://trends.revcontent.com/click.php?d=e%2FfYP0Wr5HnZ%2FIj4ALBkOhMAaakHS%2BSohFkMPncUiax9UmSCMSVS6mL%2B7EcmUAGlbbAXFoPU%2FWg2YBVyCPMC5vX1ftptCIoOwj7uIdFFsDC2Xrz42Aff2v1qdwyW0o5f9SJa3Pypbh6GmZlZ6qJD6QZ7A7V7vaBud5ptSLiOatP8SRI69lr6x0cZnwV%2F4dTfGC8I6%2F0pS%2B7Ord4Orw%2FVciCQB3tXRcXSW%2By2RBBhEJmQfUwOqa5tGi0SsKi1xxIY%2Fkb13WDdaemnmM9Sf%2Bu4k2H7tSnkmDe8iNUVq60P827lBAHueULDor%2BdSuyUFJxHO%2B2hezCD8TW7KccLEHlZ54K33LlTCwnPO0WEmt21qQg25bN5eBV8mJYamxVzh8jlCEToNoCcO7M4DDDjVvW%2Fxc1Q%2FZ1qdVe2bme7U4GA0kh6fuH8jB7%2F9JqiSrz2x7K5JBtjkrmXfA9oH742v%2FGGhXKh%2FAw0cVNKbC5ny0St5P2d%2FIr1YU5vuD%2FetV5J3cwesFmgwKwlbgz8YSYmOHZPcEQ2M5zynRXgHKImOf1%2BdBatZZOILsk7Pp38ObArP%2FdMyER4mZ4Q%2B1kRHRggeY4Bq2Me4cRZCrWLKSgl4iljJ%2BA1ko8efZEdHE%2BWNml1hHo%2FSxOdJy8EkKqKIW2FTrcaSCJ6djfffe7nKTB1IWGcGZOJCWIeecLcqP2mUjXAyALKPnQiNg6ddWDmy2M9%2B%2F0PHqDMxNsG0JAQEi9%2FAS5EeFeh20jr%2FfcbLQKDLx5qWTUh
http://trends.revcontent.com/click.php?d=7%2FhSir1YFvmDbuHRkFnQyL0PFNZP06fvG3cLMDRIci66Rj6SQ64HnmMYsnBrP4vBn3uQJJb6c8FdPwz7A5Msk%2FU6uUL2zLUF5WEQaBPGCi62cFMbgov1LX3d5NGeDHCnNI90pvhGCJ2gG7vyQmJKfUqRqJy6qh9O3o4AwaE2N%2BiasHw0memG6rOC5tefHw%2FQ26tLOxjNWcDdpttE0fx%2BEGms9pvZDdeJidFGfdjE5YlLzj57s0WPJ5mfw7JhE4BRwQ%2Bl3hpPUzbkpaGPy5CmbpEAZ5GUQ4UYTNDzzy593HotHrhkwdDmdZGrspXB6jssjVH%2F6qsYQitfyHuLKgSFrIQauYOsPcbTYEC4zyfJUZgdXw%2FbsQJQsYUMBWLXUrDGIeiDNjsgQv4sKvPAjdbjQa%2FP9MwdL598MlQ%2BdxqJmt%2Fmp9%2FCOUTDtejWxcS3CIMz5tBP9Xqqz%2BT76d0CAbrIq0i2%2F1NfvAtbo4UfZjiu0LGxfVesZBA5JhblUpD9I2T2J1UwarsgfWoK5U8FfGFEhieZ0QTHuMi%2F2InX9ndazFMH%2Beyljc4tPf91npY1NA5Jo7S%2Fb9Cqkrrmkjh1cmghUk%2F8J4XhDN%2B7Zn5%2Bjfhjwa1Z57MDaNa69C6ibAUYszqHRp6lKvQEKIlGjNwNGLdS4vJDIdVnyCNhV55b%2B3UVtRzVyiR6ZXNWDeBC0mUvlT5G%2BWy5I0Q04fDd7KIpX0cmmvcKhVcGJ4ckEVFEGIhGNL5IVqK3JnZyKpHMzh5APUAQ
http://trends.revcontent.com/click.php?d=ag4DmEVJHExv3AfD9ozp%2BFoRg9JJog07rB2JXiWz2SWAIyTCSLGlNc2pBDgIxh%2F5Y0hhcbHzC%2Bgvn2EirzkhcTlQuZLPnP2UpYOmh84M4GkeKCur7vCj%2Bu1rB4CF9Tj36Avh7XXV7rhuY2O3OLw6SP7p07KTBEDtcxWRLC6B4YLNKe1owCL7itXV9BRV6kAsrn6slWhDujBJZyHpCxQ7%2FHaHT4GwX0LSGUorIu1%2FereLVignGq99DB0sdDoeVLrcxzBsQtdGvGpEzc3UCEBhkTgEP3JbZD3Af9e8iGMyOxK2K98cvDw2yjxrSSTHfztZoLoWQyodRRH9fDU18mKzx1A8RLRX6KfA4udVg7iP3Y%2BxU5My2J7EVP5ir%2BprHbhbqP7Xif0sMg9ifbtuI9BNyWoelWqKYzJSpXGfoQaU6rLgmjAoeukek%2ByGJC6e0tI8g4MD9%2BeYzPQJIhAKexALPlV5BtfJPspfEZNTSSWTaOiHd7aWj7g7epfPSaHuBVga7HPLRPYqFcZB57TD%2F77v0UpJdIsGLftQSmZKWvnYUfnKR5b1YkgwuhpDJBoObFoKKJbhswsoMYxA09N4V4Q8UVxeMiFmas69TNJ2Fj2n4W3u4KH53AMBwGY%2B%2FovcWSJdoEaY6b%2FuLl54vgNxDpXmRS35K7O8dV36xhRpv9eWS1%2BGyRXYCJGYVl9XQdUSNi8bQQ4o%2B22cqftmneCZTiIE71y%2FrMjUKNM5w2Tz9IT%2By2s%3D
http://trends.revcontent.com/click.php?d=iulwn%2B9sr%2FYaJTnADz89n7Al06zWjlb2kEGvDBCG7XokASmtolUr1ngzgYuqsCJp7ZPeBMVjjsy6azxmV%2Fi4ZY%2BKgMS%2BHtVDf305Rm42M4qt6ZeXCJiHspG1758AxbIvH3S8Ik6xd18Yb8Nx5hfSRSzJqKC1X5uP4X2ei1cts%2B6hehaIXlsuORklV2ak%2BLFMsa9YTMjR7JVPbIka5%2BTh9Vl4LvrC5v%2B6CmsVnDMyhp5IpOqg4vC6CjmLYyOgvyh6FsR9uEoJr6HSrE6KwvrsEy5SaTkI9h4rnJCSFmMrrsjMOEDrsUQgmV2%2FMmy3ejpkkYHrtq9du3cPhzW6RWierEmUP4jbZK0i4LvMFJ8z977R8oLqttMU7tEwYhio77t%2FRiyekMbu%2FWDzTkn9pF22Y5%2Fs%2BSX1Q63KT3%2B1SrlaJQOT3%2BhPv8c5dlzhTb7b4nBKskJkebPrFOlKnnqG2BVvq4w951CfCLtDKlzf%2BzXMIrVMcc29BwGpacvHNDByoNTEhogJ1Ps1y5sU8G9jEYSeCNqsNmVvXvoXEWt4q6h%2B0jv76rY8u65lLYUC%2Bt0em8TKmjtcHEiaWmA%2FFuj97MbPUYaix5RROHSHLcN8mdc8zGdCrHcyqV14wALS53w7YHgMzeuMSM0F4WOdzHsX1GoTCgDISpcaiwug%2BLlRMSJsl1LJUgk5DD7vhnrAYdzZq9v0icYsVFvMAXIKQ332eyUfTDg6GX9VtojfAkVhogqCbgsgBKeBbckNbUQpm2FJ9WvR


Washington D.C.

Photo by Liz Lauren

If you're like me and, perhaps, do not care all that much about seeing the story of one man's fanatical quest for a
giant killer whale, I wouldn't dismiss this play so easily. No exaggeration: this production is just that incredible.

Combining Melville's poetic wordplay, an inventive staging, and the dynamic athleticism of cirque, MOBY DICK is
reimagined anew for the stage in a way that makes the story much more intriguing and, dare I say, more graspable
than ever before---even for those of us who may have found the novel to be somewhat or totally unapproachable.

Catlin's rapturous and often jaw-dropping iteration definitely highlights the stylistic reaches of live theater, where
movement, sets, lighting, sound, and costumes all serve to create a surreal, almost alien-like world, transporting the
audience to the deck of the sailing ship The Pequod, where most of the action takes place.

For two riveting hours, Melville's celebrated tome comes to life as an eye-popping, sometimes amusing, sometimes
jarring, and sometimes deeply emotional play that mixes abstract concepts with clever theater magic. Here, you'll be
in awe watching ghosts and monsters float before your eyes. You'll be amazed by the remarkable agility of these
actor-acrobats who continually defy gravity. You'll even marvel at paddle boats and ship masts gliding high above
the stage---and believe wholeheartedly in this world where lives and sanity are constantly on the balance.
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It's hard not to notice that MOBY DICK is blessed with rich aesthetics.

We immediately examine Courtney O'Neill's artistic set design, a dark, captivating collection of fabrics, ropes, gears,
and scaffolding that allow for imaginations to fill in certain spots. Smack dab in the center are suspended tubular
rings that appear like the skeletal rib cage of a whale, while below it is a rock-wood platform reminiscent of water-
deteriorated shipwrecks that have fused into the rocks of a sea bed. Sully Ratke's excellent period costumes verify
that the setting is indeed the East Coast during the mid-19th Century. William C. Kirkham's haunting and innovative
lighting designs and Rick Sim's sounds help set the often foreboding environment (my gosh, wait until you
experience a raging storm on stage---but I digress).

From the first minute in, as novice sailor Ishmael (Jamie Abelson) arrives in New Bedford, Massachusetts and utters
those infamous first words of the novel, you're instantly hooked---primarily because you will recognize an alluring
uniqueness to the proceedings right away. This isn't just some run-of-the-mill iteration of a famous novel. This is a
gripping, edge-of-your-seat adventure that will keep you enthralled and in suspense even if you've read the book
before and know exactly what lies ahead.

Experiencing the story vicariously through him, Ishmael is our tour guide to this exciting and, yep, dangerous and
life-altering journey. Though he's here to satisfy a personal "itch" for something exciting to counter his normal (but
privileged) life thus far, we will discover along with him that for others, a livelihood on a whaling ship poses many
dangers despite the promise of fair compensation and the thrill of the open seas.

Pretty much a (pun intended) fish out of water, Ishmael's first encounter, naturally, already throws him for a loop.
While lodging at a crowded inn, Ishmael is forced to share a room (and bed) with Queequeg (Anthony Fleming III),
a native Polynesian covered in tribal tattoos and who speaks broken English and is armed with a giant knife.
Ishmael's encounter with a so-called "savage" may have been scary to him at first, but looks prove to be deceiving.

The two new pals arrive in Nantucket and soon board the Pequod, where they meet the notorious Captain Ahab
(Christopher Donahue) and the rest of the interestingly multi-cultural crew of 33. The whaling ship's established crew
includes the very serious Starbuck (Walter Owen Briggs), the ship's chief mate who---as the voice of reason in most
instances---often clashes with the Captain over the true purpose of their deployment; and Stubb (Raymond Fox), the
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ship's less-combative second mate. Newly-hired Queequeg situates himself alongside harpoonists/cabin boys
Cabaco (Micah Figueroa) and Mungun (Javen Ulambayar), both of whom are also foreign born. (I admit, a little bit of
HAMILTON's "Immigrants, we get the job done" bounced in my head).

Photo by Debora Robinson.

Hovering---or, more accurately, eerily haunting---the narrative
throughout MOBY DICK are three "fates" (Kelley Abell, Cordelia Dewdney, Kasey Foster), who slither (and sing) in
and out of the action with sometimes lasting consequences over characters and, yes, plot direction. Like zombie-like
ghosts that control all, the multi-talented actresses that play these "fates" also inhabit various other female
characters that appear here and there, almost as if they take over and "possess" these other beings as they interact
with the different men that criss-cross the story (later, the three ladies even come together to play the title character).

Soon enough---as anyone even slightly familiar with the story knows---the Pequod ("adorned with the fins of slain
monsters") sets sail to enact Captain Ahab's obsessive, irrational raison d'être: to hunt down and exact revenge on
Moby Dick, the giant white whale that bit off his one leg and that has eluded him ever since (ivory-legged Ahab
wears a prosthetic to compensate).

The crew reluctantly complies with Ahab's anger-fueled quest, even though logic---and a very pointed prophecy---
suggests they do otherwise.

But, as one might have expected, Ahab is so obsessed that he's practically lost any shred of humanity he has left,
leaving his crew feeling as if they're endangering their lives following his orders. And, as evidenced by the post-
show talkback between the cast and audience during a recent performance of the play, the show's contemporary
real-world parallels are not lost on anyone, especially if you watch the news.

"We are guided only by our leader's hatred." Indeed.

Told via ingenious staging and theatrical creativity, MOBY DICK is an imaginative modern take on what feels like a
classical, pre-existing play. As characters leap and twirl and somersault about the stage (beautifully choreographed
by Sylvia Hernandez-DiStasi), you can't help, as an audience member, but to be completely rapt in the experience.
Most times, such devices are used to distract from weaknesses in a play. Here, though, it is a welcome
enhancement, helping to tell the tale with layers of mesmerizing poetry and hyper surreal drama.

Of course, the play's acting troupe---every one an acrobatically-inclined thespian---all give ferocious, searing
performances that add to the show's wow factor. Abelson does a great job standing in as the audience's proxy, a
friendly and active participant/observer. Donahue's growling Ahab is effectively menacing, yet still allows for snippets
of human vulnerability to peek out. Briggs' riveting portrait of Starbuck is also worth noticing, as is Fleming's scene-
stealing turn as Queequog. And, the play's MVP's, the three lady fates played by Abell, Dewdney, and Foster, all
command attention with every entrance and exit, even in moments when they're not the maIn Focus---only because
their presence has such an affect on the story at most times you don't want to miss a second. I also LOVED
Figueroa's believably wounded boy persona as Cabaco---so much so that when danger is present, he's the one we
root for to survive it and be okay.
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Photo by Liz Lauren.

Overall, what I found most remarkable about this production of MOBY DICK was how easily I was swept up in this
production's brilliant methodology of telling me this story---that in every lighting cue, in every flicker of a fabric, or
with every rumble, loud bang, or set change, something monumentally significant is about to go down. It's really
quite a marvel of theatricality that I willingly absorbed from my seat. The play makes it easy for an audience to
immerse itself in Ishmael's world.

This exceptional production of MOBY DICK proves that when you inject challenging, dense source material with
clever, innovative staging, then the results can be stunning and, yes, beautiful---even if it seems intimidating or
scary.

* Follow this reviewer on Twitter: @cre8iveMLQ *

Photos by Debora Robinson for South Coast Repertory and Liz Lauren for Lookingglass Theatre Company. Review also published in
OnStage.

-----

Lookingglass Theatre Company's production of MOBY DICK continues its final performances at South Coast Repertory through
February 19, 2017. Tickets can be purchased online at www.scr.org, by phone at (714) 708-5555 or by visiting the box office at 655
Town Center Drive in Costa Mesa.
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